
Roger A. Barnhart
Roger Allen Barnhart, 39,

Warfordsburg, died Saturday, October
27, 1990 in Washington County Hospi
tal, Hagerstown. He was in a hunting
accident that morning.

Born July 7, 1951 in Berkeley
Springs, WV, he was the son of Gwen
dolyn G. Barnhart of Warfordsburg
and the late James E. Barnhart.

He was a member of Faith Assem-j
bly of God. Amaranth.

Mr. Barnhart worked for Roxbury
Correctional Institute, Hagerstown.

Besides his mother, surviving are
his wife, Eileen Stinebaugh Barnhart;
two step-sons: J.R. Stinebaugh of Ber
keley Springs and Tom Stinebaugh of
Cacapon; two sisters: Norma Lee
Moats of Hancock and Patricia Ann

Dodson of Jacksonville, NC; three
brothers: Hobert Q. of New Orleans,
MD; Fames R. and Eric, both of
Warfordsburg and three step-
grandsons.

Services were held at 1:00 p.m.
Tuesday, October 30 in the Hancock
Assembly of God Church. Pastors
Delmas Bard, Robert D. Smith. Sr.
and Merle Trail officiated. Burial was
made in Mays Chapel Cemetery.

Memorial contributions may be
made to the Needmore Rescue Squad,
Ncedmore, PA 17238 or Hancock Res
cue Squad, Hancock, MD, 21750.


